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It’s August in Savannah, Georgia—hardly the season for a traditional Southern wedding with hoopskirts and
crinolines. One could die from the heat—or from a cake knife in the back...

Reagan Summerside should be devoting all her energy to her consignment shop the Prissy Fox. But when her
dear friend Chantilly Parker is arrested for murder, Reagan vows to clear her name. The victim is Simon
Ambrose, who’s found lying in his own wedding cake with a knife in his back.

Chantilly has motive (Simon broke her heart to marry wealthy Waynetta Waverly) and opportunity (crashing
the wedding in her UPS delivery truck). And she has cake on her face, and the stolen bridesmaid dress the
killer wore is in her truck. But Chantilly would never wear crinoline to kill a man!

With the help of her flamboyant auntie, KiKi, and vexing but attractive attorney Walker Boone, Reagan is
determined to save her friend—before she’s forced to turn in her brown uniform for an orange jumpsuit…
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Saunders:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or this for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Killer in Crinolines (A
Consignment Shop Mystery). All type of book could you see on many solutions. You can look for the
internet options or other social media.

Alan Durham:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for us. The book Killer in Crinolines (A Consignment Shop Mystery) was making
you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what
advantages for you. The publication Killer in Crinolines (A Consignment Shop Mystery) is not only giving
you more new information but also to become your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own
personal spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship using the book Killer in Crinolines (A
Consignment Shop Mystery). You never truly feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Leola Grant:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This Killer in Crinolines
(A Consignment Shop Mystery) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Rayford Alexander:

You can spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This Killer in Crinolines (A Consignment Shop
Mystery) is simple to deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did
not have much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you simpler to read
it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.
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