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Sports are a gift from God but we’ll waste this gift if we play for our own glory.

So how do we play for God’s glory and not our own?

This booklet for athletes, parents, and coaches provides a biblical worldview of sports so that we don’t waste
this gift. “I had the opportunity to glorify God in my sports,” C. J. writes, “and I fumbled it. I wasted my
sports. You have the opportunity, by the grace of God, not to waste yours.”
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From reader reviews:

Lynnette Cash:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive at this
point, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high.
For you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you that Don't Waste Your Sports book as
starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

David Paras:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Don't Waste Your Sports is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in
this era.

Tara Cassell:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Don't Waste Your Sports, you
could enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it?
Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Rochelle Barrick:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television programs
or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Don't Waste Your Sports can be the
response, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your free time by
reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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