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Like The Group, Mary McCarthy's classic tale about coming of age in New York, Joanna Smith Rakoff 's
richly drawn and immensely satisfying first novel details the lives of a group of Oberlin graduates whose
ambitions and friendships threaten to unravel as they chase their dreams, shed their youth, and build their
lives in Brooklyn during the late 1990s and the turn of the twenty-first century.

There's Lil, a would-be scholar whose marriage to an egotistical writer initially brings the group back
together (and ultimately drives it apart); Beth, who struggles to let go of her old beau Dave, a onetime piano
prodigy trapped by his own insecurity; Emily, an actor perpetually on the verge of success -- and starvation -
- who grapples with her jealousy of Tal, whose acting career has taken off. At the center of their orbit is wry,
charismatic Sadie Peregrine, who coolly observes her friends' mistakes but can't quite manage to avoid
making her own. As they begin their careers, marry, and have children, they must navigate the shifting
dynamics of their friendships and of the world around them.

Set against the backdrop of the vast economic and political changes of the era -- from the decadent age of
dot-com millionaires to the sobering post-September 2001 landscape -- Smith Rakoff's deeply affecting
characters and incisive social commentary are reminiscent of the great Victorian novels. This brilliant and
ambitious debut captures a generation and heralds the arrival of a bold and important new writer.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Jones:

The book A Fortunate Age: A Novel can give more knowledge and information about everything you want.
So just why must we leave the best thing like a book A Fortunate Age: A Novel? Some of you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim that will book can give many info for us. It is absolutely right.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for
each other; you could share all of these. Book A Fortunate Age: A Novel has simple shape but you know: it
has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it
is very wonderful.

Wilbert Westerfield:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high. For
yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of A Fortunate Age: A Novel
book as nice and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Robert Olsen:

Here thing why this kind of A Fortunate Age: A Novel are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all
examining a book is good but it really depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. A Fortunate Age: A Novel giving you information deeper since different ways, you
can find any reserve out there but there is no guide that similar with A Fortunate Age: A Novel. It gives you
thrill looking at journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is
possibly can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in
your means home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the
form of A Fortunate Age: A Novel in e-book can be your substitute.

Sandra Birk:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
if those information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one is
suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource then
you buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not
happen within you if you take A Fortunate Age: A Novel as the daily resource information.
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