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Millions of Robert Jordan fans will rejoice at the release of the ninth book in the phenomenally bestselling
series The Wheel of Time. The sequel to the #1 New York Times bestseller The Path of Daggers, which swept
the nation like a firestorm, Winter's Heart continues a remarkable tale that is mesmerizing an entire
generation of readers.

Rand is on the run with Min, and in Cairhein, Cadsuane is trying to figure out where he is headed. Rand's
destination is, in fact, one she has never considered.

Mazrim Taim, leader of the Black Tower, is revealed to be a liar. But what is he up to?

Faile, with the Aiel Maidens, Bain and Chiad, and her companions, Queen Alliandre and Morgase, is
prisoner of Savanna's sept.

Perrin is desperately searching for Faile. With Elyas Machera, Berelain, the Prophet and a very mixed
"army" of disparate forces, he is moving through country rife with bandits and roving Seanchan. The
Forsaken are ever more present, and united, and the man called Slayer stalks Tel'aran'rhiod and the
wolfdream.

In Ebou Dar, the Seanchan princess known as Daughter of the Nine Moons arrives--and Mat, who had been
recuperating in the Tarasin Palace, is introduced to her. Will the marriage that has been foretold come about?

There are neither beginnings or endings to the turning of the Wheel of Time. But it is a beginning....
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From reader reviews:

Celina Ziolkowski:

The particular book Winter's Heart (The Wheel of Time, Book 9) will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If you try to
find new book to read, this book very suitable to you. The book Winter's Heart (The Wheel of Time, Book 9)
is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Gerald Chisholm:

This Winter's Heart (The Wheel of Time, Book 9) is great reserve for you because the content which can be
full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute.
This book reveal it info accurately using great manage word or we can say no rambling sentences in it. So if
you are read this hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Winter's Heart (The Wheel of
Time, Book 9) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one. We can say
that no e-book that offer you world in ten or fifteen small right but this book already do that. So , this really
is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

Cruz Fleury:

The book untitled Winter's Heart (The Wheel of Time, Book 9) contain a lot of information on this. The
writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author will take
you in the new period of time of literary works. You can read this book because you can please read on your
smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice read.

Donna Valdez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that query
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. So you
know that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about something by book. A substantial
number of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is Winter's Heart (The
Wheel of Time, Book 9).
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