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"Through wisdom and wit, using an eclectic array of sources, Yisroel conveys many inspiring ideas about
Judaism as well as gentle guidance on how to lead a more meaningful life. " — Former Senator and Vice-
Presidential Candidate Joseph Lieberman The Hidden Path is an exhilarating and extraordinary journey of
the mind, body, and soul from critically acclaimed musician and artist Yisroel Juskowitz. In it, many of the
most important concepts in Judaism are explored; from the Sabbath, to the Land of Israel, to Prayer, Torah,
and Redemption. It also contains chapters on many of life's biggest issues; from Love, to Creativity, to
Suffering, and Health. Anyone looking to lead a happier and more meaningful life will find comfort and
insight in the volume from one of the most creative imaginations in the Jewish world today. Also by Yisroel
Juskowitz: the popular debut album "The Narrow Bridge." Critical Praise for "The Hidden Path": "A book
that masterfully pulls together the most inspirational, understandable and accessible wisdom on some of the
most important foundation concepts of Judaism. Throughout the book, Yisroel Juskowicz's love of G-d
bursts forth on every page, lifting the reader into chapter after chapter, always wanting more." -Lori Palatnik,
author, international speaker, Founding Director of The Jewish Women's Renaissance Project "Yisroel's
book is full of great stories, insights and ideas designed to help its reader better appreciate Judaism and a
connection to Hashem." -Charlie Harary, Esq. world renowned speaker, radio show Host ""Yisroel Juskowitz
is an artist and musician. He has succeeded in making music and art out of the fundamental principles of
Yiddishkeit. "The Hidden Path" is an inspiring introduction to the beauty of being a Jew." -Rabbi Moshe
Weinberger
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From reader reviews:

Alvin Maltby:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the
Mind, Body and Soul. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Provided that we know
about how is important any book The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the Mind, Body and Soul.
You can add information and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right,
because from book you can realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you
will find yourself known. About simple factor until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era,
we are able to open a book as well as searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should use it
when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Jillian Harrington:

The ability that you get from The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the Mind, Body and Soul is a
more deep you looking the information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the
Mind, Body and Soul giving you excitement feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-
known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having
this specific The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the Mind, Body and Soul instantly.

Peter Lombard:

This book untitled The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the Mind, Body and Soul to be one of
several books that will best seller in this year, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of
benefit on it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it via online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read
this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

David Thompson:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the
story how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When
you read this The Hidden Path: An Extraordinary Journey of the Mind, Body and Soul, you can tells your
family, friends and also soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading



a e-book.
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