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For some kids, high school is a time they will never forget filled with friends, Friday night football games,
and first loves. For others, however, severe and long-term bullying can make high school damaging at best
and even fatal. Alarming statistics show that the phenomenon known as bullycide is on the rise and that the
classrooms and gymnasiums parents expect their children to be safe in may be more dangerous than once
thought. They certainly were for Daniel Mendez, whose harrowing life story is told in this book by his
mother, Anna DiPronio-Mendez. Using her own son's tragic story, the author puts readers in the shoes of her
young son who, at only sixteen years old with his entire life ahead of him, killed himself after years of
relentless bullying. Daniel's story helps readers understand what it feels like to be a teen on the wrong side of
bullying and also the fatal consequences of looking the other way. Anna bravely revisits the untimely death
of her only son in hopes that Daniel's story can create the much needed change that must take place on
school campuses and in all of society so that bullycide can one day be a thing of the past. This book is
written not only for Daniel, but for every child who has dreaded stepping foot in a school's hallways for fear
of assault and abuse.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Beckman:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They should answer that question due to the
fact just their can do which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on guardería until university need this kind of If These Halls Could Talk to read.

Pamela Adair:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This If These Halls Could Talk book is readable simply by you who hate
those perfect word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience
without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer connected with If
These Halls Could Talk content conveys objective easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-
book are not different in the articles but it just different as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking If These Halls
Could Talk is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Thomas Garcia:

Typically the book If These Halls Could Talk has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can
get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes some research prior to
write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after looking over this book.

Wilfred Walker:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose
the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as
of book If These Halls Could Talk. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book,
it could possibly add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware
about e-book. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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