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Imprisoned by memories, Claudia Campbell lives each day in the shadow of a ten-year-old murder. Who can
set her free?

On the way home from a football game, a decade earlier, a masked gunman opened fi re on a Texas school
bus. Cheerleading coach B.J. Remington was killed, but her murderer was never found. Claudia, who had a
close friendship with the young, spirited teacher, constantly relives the anguish of that day, caught in one
moment in time. When her husband, the assistant district attorney, becomes determined to uncover the
mystery of that tragedy, the secrets buried over the years threaten to tear their family apart.

Officer Casio Hightower will never forget the day his dreams were destroyed. A star quarterback with a
promising future, Casio was on top of the world - until one bullet changed everything. He is eager to help
Victor Campbell find B.J.'s killer, the man who shot him. Maybe solving the case will help silence the
demons driving Casio to hurt the woman he loves.

As the Campbells and Casio teeter on the brink of losing everything, will they be able to discover that what
begins at the crossing ends at the cross?
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From reader reviews:

Darren Meekins:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of various ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this The
Crossing: A Novel, you are able to tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a reserve.

Jeffrey Evans:

Often the book The Crossing: A Novel has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read this book you can get
a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The writer makes some research prior to
write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may get the point easily after scanning this book.

Beverly McClendon:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book
that need more time to be examine. The Crossing: A Novel can be your answer given it can be read by you
who have those short extra time problems.

Katie Grossi:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This The Crossing: A Novel can give you a lot of close friends because by
you investigating this one book you have point that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting
person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer you information that
maybe your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than additional make you to be great men and women.
So , why hesitate? Let's have The Crossing: A Novel.
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