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The Scramble for Africa analyzes the current humanitarian crisis in Darfur and the activist movements
surrounding it, thereby taking on both the US government and the Save Darfur coalition alike. The authors
present the basic information on the political and military aspects of the conflict, examine the options, and
suggest ways forward, always with a concern for the broader inter national implications and for the hundreds
of thousands of victims.

This meticulously researched work gives the history of Sudan—especially the Darfur region—in relation to
US and Western objectives, discussing, at length, the immensely harmful role the United States played in
Sudan in the 1970s and 1980s through Washington’s support of repressive regimes in Khartoum.

Alongside this, some of the more dubious aspects of the Save Darfur movement in the United States is
examined, such as the sidelining of Muslim and Sudanese voices, the lobbying for questionable goals, and
the perceived support of the Bush administration’s policy objectives.

Finally, the authors also assess the analysis presented of the Darfur conflict by those on the radical Left and
evaluate the merits of their opposition to the use of UN peacekeepers on anti-imperial grounds.

Steven Fake is an activist and political commentator; he is a graduate of the University of Pittsburgh and a
member of the Lucy Parsons Center.

Kevin Funk earned degrees in journalism, political science, and Latin American studies from the University
of Pittsburgh. An activist himself, Funk writes frequently on US foreign policy.
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Scholz:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Scramble for Africa: Darfur--Intervention and
the USA will make you to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know
about almost everything. But some of you think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not
make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or ideal book with you?

Thomas Burke:

Now a day people that Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Looking at a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Scramble for Africa: Darfur--
Intervention and the USA book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the
details in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Cynthia Haynes:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story
as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the books. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their skill
in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write for their book. One of them is this Scramble for
Africa: Darfur--Intervention and the USA.

Megan Jordan:

The publication with title Scramble for Africa: Darfur--Intervention and the USA includes a lot of
information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist
new knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world right
now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring
you within new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read
that anywhere you want.
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