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This book should be at the side of every particle and nuclear physics graduate student and professional.
Journeys Beyond the Standard Model starts with a detailed and modern account of the Standard Model of
elementary particle physics, the paradigm of particle physics for the last twenty years. Its timely release
coincides with the recent dramatic discovery that the neutrino has a finite mass, which is the first indication
that the Standard Model is an incomplete description of fundamental physics at short distances. This book
presents in detail three possible generalizations of the Standard Model: its extension to accommodate
neutrino masses; its extension to avoid CP violation in the strong interactions by introducing a new particle,
the axion; and finally, its generalization to low-energy supersymmetry, which provides a link between the
standard model and Einstein's theory of general relativity.This new graduate text complements the author's
previous book, Modern Field Theory: A Primer, which focuses on the methodology of particle physics. Its
aim is to give students and professional physicists alike a thorough comprehension of the phenomena
described by the Standard Model, while keeping track of the most recent and cutting-edge principles of
elementary particle physics.
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From reader reviews:

Rosa Rogers:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Sure, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than other is high. In your
case who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Journeys Beyond The Standard Model
(Frontiers in Physics) book as beginning and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually
more than just a book.

Richard Ybarra:

The book with title Journeys Beyond The Standard Model (Frontiers in Physics) has lot of information that
you can study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of
the internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you
want.

Thomas Tritt:

The particular book Journeys Beyond The Standard Model (Frontiers in Physics) has a lot details on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author.
This articles author makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you
can get the point easily after scanning this book.

Eun Russell:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This kind of Journeys Beyond The Standard Model (Frontiers in
Physics) can give you a lot of good friends because by you checking out this one book you have issue that
they don't and make you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more
than various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let's have Journeys Beyond The Standard
Model (Frontiers in Physics).
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