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Published in partnership with Concordia Publishing House, this new full-color children’s Bible combines the
complete ESV Bible text with 130 vibrant illustrations of major Bible stories. Accompanying each full-page
illustration is the Bible story itself, clearly and accurately retold for young readers—and for the parents,
grandparents, and teachers who read to them.  Each story includes a Key Bible Verse to memorize,
Additional Readings for discovering more of the story throughout the Bible, and simple Reflection Questions
to help children begin to understand and apply God’s Word. Colorful icons make it easy for young readers to
see where each story is found in the Bible text and to locate the illustration that goes with it. 

In addition, dozens of Bible characters are profiled throughout the pages, and color call-out sections provide
illustrated facts about important Bible objects, structures, and places. Each Bible book begins with a child-
friendly introduction, highlighting the important characters and themes found in it.

The ESV Seek and Find Bible is the ideal first “real” Bible for pre-readers and young readers, ages 5 to 9, to
grow up with. It is also a wonderful resource for parents to use in family Bible reading and for teachers who
teach the Bible to young children.

130 full-page, full-color illustrations●

Simple Bible story retellings for each illustration●

Age-appropriate introductions to each Bible book●

Key Verses to memorize●

Illustrated profiles of more than 50 major Bible characters●

Illustrated facts about Bible objects, structures, and places●

Reflections Questions for children, parents and teachers●
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From reader reviews:

Julia Hayes:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really opposite from that. A
single activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride
on and with addition details. Even you love ESV Seek and Find Bible, you can enjoy both. It is great
combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind
hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Lisa Marsh:

The book untitled ESV Seek and Find Bible contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains
your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do certainly
not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author will bring
you in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can please read on your
smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish
to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.

Kai Martin:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to
you is ESV Seek and Find Bible this book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world
now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer require to
explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That is
why this book appropriate all of you.

Willie Randolph:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like ESV Seek and Find
Bible which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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