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On July 21, 1861, two inexperienced armies of a divided nation clashed for the first time in Manassas,
Virginia. As the 35,000-strong Union forces began their long-awaited campaign to capture Richmond, the
public gathered to watch what they thought would be a colorful pageantry. Neither the citizens nor the
soldiers could conceive of the long war that lay ahead. Culminating in a stalwart defensive fight by Thomas
"Stonewall" Jackson's Virginia Brigade, the Battle of Bull Run marked the Confederacy's first victory. By
the day's end, after ten hours of fierce fighting, soldiers on both sides were shocked by the violence and
destruction they had encountered. As the Union army retreated they took with them any notion that the war's
outcome would be decided quickly. This book vividly evokes the real-life experiences of the men on the
battlefield in graphic novel format and includes eight additional pages of background information detailing
the key players, the experience of the forces, and the aftermath of the battle.
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From reader reviews:

William Deck:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book this
improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book you read,
if you want get more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want experience happy read one
having theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the The War is On!: Battle of First Bull Run
(Graphic History) is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Barbara Morton:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of several
ways to share the information or even their idea. Second, studying a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to imagine the
story how the character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this The War is On!: Battle of First Bull Run (Graphic History), you can tells your family, friends
in addition to soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-
book.

Jack Scala:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you learn a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as well
as soon. The The War is On!: Battle of First Bull Run (Graphic History) will give you new experience in
reading through a book.

Heather Delph:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through
a book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book
everywhere? It alright you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like
The War is On!: Battle of First Bull Run (Graphic History) which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out
this book? Let's find.
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