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There are some things money can’t buy… It was no better than kidnapping! Besides, women came with too
many issues. Dubious, T.J. Blake refuses the request to retrieve the daughter of a wealthy widow. But when
the tune of five thousand dollars dances in his ears, he quickly changes his mind. Surely this woman’s
daughter couldn’t be as bad as her snobbish mother. And if she was, he’d have the rope ready. There’s only
one condition to retrieving the stubborn beauty in question—Sarah is to be delivered untouched. After a
lifetime of dealing with outlaws of the worst kind, surely Blake can escort one woman across the country
without giving into temptation. He has five thousand reasons to ensure it will be an easy task. But Blake
doesn’t bank on the value of his heart being worth far more than Sarah’s Bounty... All that Sarah knows
changes the night she is grabbed. Filled with questions, anger and hurt at discovering her whole life has been
a lie, Sarah resolves to find out why her natural mother would abandon her to be raised in a saloon while she
lives a life of luxury. To gain the answers she seeks, she calls a truce with her kidnapper, agreeing to follow
his rules. To ward off suspicion, they pretend to be man and wife. But how far will the role go? Why
couldn’t her captor have been hideous? Blake causes stirrings in Sarah she’s never felt before and soon she
has a request of her own. Only when she’s denied the second kiss she’s so curious about does she face the
truth—is the promised payout worth more to Blake than her love?
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From reader reviews:

Norman Brown:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Sarah's Bounty. Try to face the book Sarah's Bounty as your buddy. It means
that it can for being your friend when you truly feel alone and beside associated with course make you
smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you considerably more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , let us make new experience and also knowledge with
this book.

Ellen Omalley:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or details even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know what one you should start with. This Sarah's Bounty is our recommendation to help
you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Cynthia Johnson:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Sarah's Bounty, you are able to enjoy
both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen
its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Victor Havens:

You could spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This Sarah's Bounty is simple to create you can
read it in the playground, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to bring
the particular printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save
the particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys
this book.
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