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Our daily lives are filled with consumption—$1.50 for a cup of coffee, $5.95 for a magazine, $17.99 for
headphones, $1.79 for cough drops, $36.00 for a haircut. Whether bought out of necessity or indulgence,
purchased alone or in a group, everything we buy has its own story to tell. We buy art supplies while feeling
inspired, CDs while shopping with friends, and a new pair of jeans to give us a lift when we are feeling blue.
Yet, these powerfully emotional experiences can be fleeting—quickly erased by the pull of the next "must-
have" acquisition. InObsessive Consumption, Portland-based artist Kate Bingaman-Burt holds up a mirror to
her own obsession with shopping and acquisition. Faced with a mounting pile of postgraduation credit card
debt, Bingaman-Burt concocted a unique artistic response to this all-too-common dilemma. She picked up a
pen and began drawing her monthly credit card statements, painstakingly recreating every last ledger line
and decimal point, vowing to continue serving her artistic penance until her debt was repaid. As a relief from
this project—turning the idea of "retail therapy" on its ear—Bingaman-Burt began drawing one of her
purchases from each day, losing herself in the items, patterns, simple lines, and typography.

Obsessive Consumption represents a selection of three years of Bingaman-Burt's delightful ink drawings of
sundry items. Accompanied by witty and insightful annotations, these drawings mock her own relationship
with her purchases and put a personal face on the mass-produced items of our shared experience. Readers
can catch a glimpse into the life of the artist from the collection, which includes wedding bands, a dog, a
moving truck, handmade items from friends, Mississippi beer, Portland pizza, and lots of pens and drawing
paper to support her drawing habit. A celebration of the beauty of the everyday, Obsessive Consumption
presents a microcosm of consumer culture that will appeal to everyone from a thirteen-year-old mall-dweller
to a middle-aged anticonsumerism advocate.
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From reader reviews:

Nelson Wyatt:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you want truly feel happy
read one along with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The Obsessive Consumption: What Did
You Buy Today? is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Howard Joyce:

The publication with title Obsessive Consumption: What Did You Buy Today? posesses a lot of information
that you can understand it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new understanding
the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world today. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Floyd Eichner:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Obsessive Consumption: What Did You Buy Today?
can give you a lot of good friends because by you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't
and make anyone more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than
various other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let me have Obsessive Consumption: What
Did You Buy Today?.

Louise Denison:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got students? We believe that that query
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you also
know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important and also book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book.
Amount types of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is Obsessive Consumption: What
Did You Buy Today?.
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