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In an increasingly competitive marketplace, growth is essential for the survival of any firm. How to Grow
your Firm provides specialist support and structure for those needing to generate or enhance growth within
their firm. This practical guide will not only help you to create a clear direction for your firm to secure
increased growth but also improve the focus and capability of the whole firm, individual practices and
individual fee earners. This special report will outline the key drivers of growth within your business and
identify the gaps in your current approach. It will help your firm to invest in areas proven to generate return,
to better align activities to achieve greater results and to reduce wasted effort and duplication - enabling your
firm to become an even more profitable and successful business.This practical work offers: a clear, logical
approach and structure which focuses on the key issues a clear and original model to guide thinking real-life
case studies exploring problems and their resolution unique access to benchmark studies and research, based
on over 1,000 professional services firms (including over 500 law firms) checklists and diagnostics to review
performance and identify gaps an approach to generate better outcomes from training, client management
and other strategic and business development initiatives links to other useful resources including the ability
to benchmark your firm's performance against a peer group of similar firms. How to Grow your Firm is
essential for all firms looking to define and implement a strategy to generate, sustain and grow revenue. It is
required reading for members of the partnership board, managing partners, CEOs, and senior partners,
practice directors, COO, and heads of marketing and business development.All those in other roles which a
responsibility or desire to help their firm grow will also benefit, for example specialism heads, other partners,
Heads of HR and IT, and all other marketing and business development staff.
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From reader reviews:

Desiree Schwindt:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't
like reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you should have this How to Grow Your Firm.

Coleman Jones:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book How to Grow Your Firm. All
type of book are you able to see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Mary Deleon:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a publication your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high. In
your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you that How to Grow Your Firm book as basic and
daily reading guide. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Sheila Kilburn:

The reason why? Because this How to Grow Your Firm is an unordinary book that the inside of the e-book
waiting for you to snap this but latter it will surprise you with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside
it was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content interior easier to
understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating
having this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of rewards than the
other book get such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking means. So , still want to hold off
having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.
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