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This book, which is based on Pólya's method of problem solving, aids students in their transition from
calculus (or precalculus) to higher-level mathematics. The book begins by providing a great deal of guidance
on how to approach definitions, examples, and theorems in mathematics and ends with suggested projects for
independent study.

 

Students will follow Pólya's four step approach: analyzing the problem, devising a plan to solve the problem,
carrying out that plan, and then determining the implication of the result. In addition to the Pólya approach to
proofs, this book places special emphasis on reading proofs carefully and writing them well. The authors
have included a wide variety of problems, examples, illustrations and exercises, some with hints and
solutions, designed specifically to improve the student's ability to read and write proofs.

 

Historical connections are made throughout the text, and students are encouraged to use the rather extensive
bibliography to begin making connections of their own. While standard texts in this area prepare students for
future courses in algebra, this book also includes chapters on sequences, convergence, and metric spaces for
those wanting to bridge the gap between the standard course in calculus and one in analysis.
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From reader reviews:

Kerri Goodman:

This Reading, Writing, and Proving: A Closer Look at Mathematics (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics)
tend to be reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The main reason of this
Reading, Writing, and Proving: A Closer Look at Mathematics (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) can be
one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you
actually with information that might be will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is actually handy, you
can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed types.
Beside that this Reading, Writing, and Proving: A Closer Look at Mathematics (Undergraduate Texts in
Mathematics) forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of
critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Cameron Trammell:

You can find this Reading, Writing, and Proving: A Closer Look at Mathematics (Undergraduate Texts in
Mathematics) by check out the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve
issue if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply by written
or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking
of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more
information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still up-
date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

John Starr:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library
or make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Reading, Writing, and Proving: A Closer Look at Mathematics
(Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) can make you truly feel more interested to read.

John Bonilla:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of news. Within
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just



trying to find the Reading, Writing, and Proving: A Closer Look at Mathematics (Undergraduate Texts in
Mathematics) when you desired it?
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