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Do you harbor passionate otherworldly desires where the normal and paranormal collide? Let Harlequin®
Nocturne bring you into dark and dangerous territory where your senses will be awakened.

Harlequin® Nocturne features two new full-length paranormal romances every month!

HER WEREWOLF HERO  by Michele Hauf

A “find and sieze” mission that should have been easy for Retriever Bron Everhart. Except the werewolf had
no idea the object would be inside a breathing, beautiful woman. Kizzy Lewis needed the heart to live. But
others—even more desperate than Bron's employers—desired the heart at any cost.  After just one touch,
Bron knew he would do anything to protect Kizzy. The only way to truly save her was to journey into
Purgatory itself. And for that, he had to hope he could return before she was lost to him forever.

IMMORTAL REDEEMED by Linda Thomas-Sundstrom

Immortal Kellan Ladd has spent centuries looking for the one woman who can put an end to his immortality.
But that woman, Kellan Ladd, has no idea of her monumental task. Or how much this rebel knight's
attraction to her will complicate his mission.  The leather-clad, Harley-riding stranger was the sexiest man
McKenna Randall had ever met. From the minute they touched, she knew they were connected. Now she's
about to find out just how tightly bound they are when they must go head-to-head with a nest of deadly
vampires…

Look for 2 new paranormal stories every month from Harlequin® Nocturne!

Join HarlequinMyRewards.com to earn FREE books and more. Earn points for all your Harlequin purchases
from wherever you shop.
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From reader reviews:

Jeraldine Thurman:

Typically the book Harlequin Nocturne April 2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal Redeemed will
bring one to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique.
In case you try to find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book Harlequin Nocturne April
2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal Redeemed is much recommended to you you just read. You can
also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Julia Faulkner:

The reason why? Because this Harlequin Nocturne April 2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal
Redeemed is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will
shock you with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who write the
book in such incredible way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining method but
still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going
to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book get such as help
improving your proficiency and your critical thinking means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I
ended up you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

Jo Villegas:

This Harlequin Nocturne April 2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal Redeemed is fresh way for you
who has curiosity to look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting
deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having small amount of digest in
reading this Harlequin Nocturne April 2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal Redeemed can be the
light food for yourself because the information inside this particular book is easy to get by means of anyone.
These books build itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book type. People
who think that in e-book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is
not any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for
an individual. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book variety for your better life along with knowledge.

Ali Ellison:

Reserve is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen require book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. From
the book Harlequin Nocturne April 2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal Redeemed we can acquire
more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Only
choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life at this book
Harlequin Nocturne April 2016 Box Set: Her Werewolf Hero/Immortal Redeemed. You can more pleasing



than now.
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