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For millions of readers the world over, the name Pern is magical, conjuring up grand vistas of a distant planet
whose blue skies are patrolled by brave dragons and their noble riders, a paradise threatened by the periodic
fall of deadly Thread. But not all dangers descend from the skies. Now, in their third collaboration, Anne
McCaffrey and her son, Todd McCaffrey, spin a tale of a mysterious illness that may succeed in doing what
centuries of Threadfall could not: kill every last human on Pern.

Life in the Harper Hall is busy for best friends Kindan, Nonala, and Kelsa. As the only female apprentices,
Nonala and Kelsa are the butt of jokes and easy targets for the bully Vaxoram and his cronies. But when
Kindan springs to Kelsa’s defense, he winds up in a fight for his life against the older, bigger Vaxoram–a
fight that will lead to a surprising friendship.

Meanwhile, in nearby Fort Hold, a clutch of fire-lizard eggs is about to hatch, and Lord Bemin’s beautiful
young daughter, Koriana, is determined to Impress one of the delightful creatures. At the hatching, Kindan
Impresses a fire-lizard of his own . . . and wins the heart of Koriana. But Lord Bemin mistrusts harpers and
will not hear of a match between his daughter and the low-born Kindan.

Then fate intervenes in the form of a virulent plague as fast-spreading as it is deadly. Arising suddenly, as if
out of nowhere, the contagion decimates hold after hold, paying no heed to distinctions of birth. In this
feverish crucible, friendship and love will be tested to the breaking point and beyond. For with Threadfall
scant years away, the Dragonriders dare not expose themselves to infection, and it will fall to Kindan and his
fellow apprentices to bravely search for a cure and save humanity.

The price of failure is unthinkable. But the price of success may be even harder to bear.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Pedro Engle:

The ability that you get from Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) could be the more deep you searching the
information that hide in the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is
hard to comprehend but Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author
conveys their point in particular way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the idea because the
author of this reserve is well-known enough. That book also makes your current vocabulary increase well.
Making it easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly
recommend you for having this kind of Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) instantly.

Elizabeth Frizzell:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) is
simple bringing you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not have got
much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you better to read it. You
can save often the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys
this book.

Robert Mayo:

Beside this kind of Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get
nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from your
oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you occasionally
have book but you do not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this
inside your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island.
Use you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from now!

Andrew Taylor:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6) can give you a lot of close
friends because by you considering this one book you have factor that they don't and make you actually more
like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step for you to get success. This e-book offer
you information that possibly your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than some other make you to be
great people. So , why hesitate? We should have Dragon Harper (Pern Book 6).
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