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The #1 New York Times bestselling author presents a riveting novel of a canine Search and Rescue
volunteer who fights danger and finds love in the Pacific Northwest wilderness.

To most people, Fiona Bristow seems to have an idyllic life—a quaint house on an island off Seattle’s coast,
a thriving dog-training school and a challenging volunteer job performing Canine Search and Rescue. Not to
mention her three intensely loyal Labs. But Fiona got to this point by surviving a nightmare.

Several years ago, Fiona was the only survivor of the Red Scarf Killer, who shot and killed Fiona’s cop
fiancé and his K-9 partner.

On Orcas Island, Fiona has found the peace and solitude necessary to rebuild her life. But all that changes on
the day Simon Doyle barrels up her drive, desperate for her help. He’s an intensely private wood artist and
the reluctant owner of an out-of-control puppy named Jaws.

As Fiona embarks on training Jaws, and Simon begins to appreciate both dog and trainer, the past tears back
into Fiona’s life. A copycat killer has emerged out of the shadows, a man whose bloodlust has been
channeled by a master with one motive: to reclaim the woman who slipped out of his hands . . .
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From reader reviews:

Michael Harmon:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book The Search will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you
think in which open or reading the book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they might be
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or appropriate book with you?

Joyce Pippin:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also become a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of guide
you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want really feel happy
read one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the The Search is kind of guide
which is giving the reader unstable experience.

John Coffin:

Often the book The Search has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of
gain. The book was authored by the very famous author. The author makes some research ahead of write this
book. This specific book very easy to read you may get the point easily after reading this book.

Karin Decker:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified as of
book The Search. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it may add your
knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about book. It
can bring you from one location to other place.
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