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George R.R. Martin has been called "the American Tolkien" by Time Magazine, and now his landmark
fantasy series is being adapted to a graphic format, starting with the first book of the series: A Game of
Thrones. The premiere issue introduces readers to George's world, adapting the prologue and first three
chapters of the novel, and bringing onto the graphic stage such iconic characters as Eddard and Catelyn
Stark, Jon Snow, young Bran Stark, and Daenerys Targaryen. This novel has also been adapted as a major
miniseries by HBO - with HBO's highest ratings to date, since having premiered on April 17, 2011!
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From reader reviews:

James Shaw:

In other case, little folks like to read book A Game of Thrones, Issue #1. You can choose the best book if you
like reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a new book A Game of Thrones, Issue
#1. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right,
simply because from book you can learn everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you
can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can easily
open a book or maybe searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel fed up
to go to the library. Let's learn.

Candy Yazzie:

The book untitled A Game of Thrones, Issue #1 contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her
idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you
can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The author gives you in the new period of
time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or program,
so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you
can available their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.

Leah Pelton:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This guide A Game of Thrones, Issue #1 was filled about science. Spend your time to
add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading the
book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the
modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Gwen Anderson:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. Through the book A Game of Thrones, Issue #1 we can take more advantage. Don't you to be creative
people? To be creative person must like to read a book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your
aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this time book A Game of Thrones, Issue #1. You can
more inviting than now.
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