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There are many stories we can tell about the past, and we are not, perhaps, as free as we might imagine in our
choice of which stories to tell, or where those stories end. John Arnold's addition to Oxford's popular Very
Short Introductions series is a stimulating essay about how people study and understand history. The book
begins by inviting us to think about various questions provoked by our investigation of history, and then
explores the ways in which these questions have been answered in the past. Such key concepts as causation,
interpretation, and periodization are introduced by way of concrete examples of how historians work, thus
giving the reader a sense of the excitement implicit in discovering the past--and ourselves.

The aim throughout History: A Very Short Introduction is to discuss theories of history in a general, pithy,
and accessible manner, rather than delve into specific periods. This is a book that will appeal to all students
and general readers with an interest in history or historiography.

About the Series:
Oxford's Very Short Introductions series offers concise and original introductions to a wide range of
subjects--from Islam to Sociology, Politics to Classics, Literary Theory to History, and Archaeology to the
Bible. Not simply a textbook of definitions, each volume in this series provides trenchant and provocative--
yet always balanced and complete--discussions of the central issues in a given discipline or field. Every Very
Short Introduction gives a readable evolution of the subject in question, demonstrating how the subject has
developed and how it has influenced society. Eventually, the series will encompass every major academic
discipline, offering all students an accessible and abundant reference library. Whatever the area of study that
one deems important or appealing, whatever the topic that fascinates the general reader, the Very Short
Introductions series has a handy and affordable guide that will likely prove indispensable.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Handy:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this History: A Very Short Introduction
book since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred percent
guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Todd James:

The e-book untitled History: A Very Short Introduction is the guide that recommended to you you just read.
You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you. The language that writer use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of History: A Very Short Introduction from the publisher to make you
more enjoy free time.

Matthew Fry:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition details. Even you love History: A Very Short Introduction, you could enjoy both. It
is good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind
hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Andre Smith:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of
book History: A Very Short Introduction. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical that, you
must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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