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Deeply affecting and diverse in perspective, The Poetry of the American Civil War is the first comprehensive
volume to focus entirely on poetry written and published during the Civil War. Of the nearly one thousand
books of poetry published in the 1860s, some two hundred addressed the war in some way, and these
collectively present a textured portrait of life during the conflict. The poets represented here hail from the
North and the South, and at times mirror each other uncannily. Among them are housewives, doctors,
preachers, bankers, journalists, and teachers. Their verse reflects the day-to-day reality of war, death, and
destruction, and it contemplates questions of faith, slavery, society, patriotism, and politics. This is an
essential volume for poetry lovers, historians, and Civil War enthusiasts alike.
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Fowler:

The book The Poetry of the American Civil War can give more knowledge and information about everything
you want. Exactly why must we leave a good thing like a book The Poetry of the American Civil War?
Several of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim that book can give many information
for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for
that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these. Book The Poetry of the American Civil War has
simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world
by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Douglas Whatley:

The book untitled The Poetry of the American Civil War contain a lot of information on this. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do
certainly not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will
bring you in the new period of time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read
on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation
you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a
nice learn.

Martin Solomon:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up being
exactly added. This guide The Poetry of the American Civil War was filled concerning science. Spend your
extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has distinct feel when
they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a
publication. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

James Bassler:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes looking at,
not only science book but also novel and The Poetry of the American Civil War or maybe others sources
were given knowledge for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel wish to read more and more.
Science publication was created for teacher or even students especially. Those publications are helping them
to include their knowledge. In other case, beside science publication, any other book likes The Poetry of the
American Civil War to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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