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This second volume is a compendium of video game synopses as well as a feast for the eyes with literally
thousands of vivid, high-resolution screen shots; it provides a comprehensive visual tour through the world
of PC and video gaming. Sorted by genre, more than 100 of the latest, most exciting software titles are
reviewed with information of interest to players, parents, and industry professionals. Each game is featured
in a two-page spread that includes detailed game summaries, analysis, and strategies; nine in-game screen
shots; lists of games with similar skill and strategy requirements; appropriate age range; notes ESRB content
ratings; complete technological specifications; and more. Feature stories are included throughout the book,
covering game-related topics such as multiplayer online gaming, games in movies, and the future of gaming.
The book also includes useful reference tools such as an illustrated glossary, an overview of game
publishers, and information on current hardware platforms such as Sony's new PS3, Nintendo's Wii, and
handheld systems, including the Nintendo DS and Sony PSP.
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From reader reviews:

Fabiola Gaylor:

The book The Book of Games Volume 2: The Ultimate Reference on PC & Video Games (Book of Games
series) has a lot associated with on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book
was authored by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research before write this book.
This book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after perusing this book.

Lori Suda:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are there when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the particular book you have
read will be The Book of Games Volume 2: The Ultimate Reference on PC & Video Games (Book of Games
series).

George Tucker:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is known as of
book The Book of Games Volume 2: The Ultimate Reference on PC & Video Games (Book of Games
series). Contain your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and
make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from
one destination for a other place.

John Fouts:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is published or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of news.
Within this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social similar to newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the The Book of Games Volume 2: The Ultimate Reference on PC & Video Games (Book of Games
series) when you necessary it?
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