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Adolf Hitler wrote this book when he was in prison for his political activities. During that time, Germany
had been weakened by the Treaty of Versailles, and France had seized several parts of Germany. France was
also encouraging separatist movements in the Rhineland and in Bavaria.

After the First World War, the social and economic conditions in Germany were also deteriorating. In this
scenario, many Germans were beginning to feel angry and resentful of the way their country had been treated
by the Treaty of Versailles. Unrest was beginning to build up, and many political movements were springing
up with dreams of reclaiming Germany's lost power and status.

Hitler was part of the political movement that stood for the unity of the German nation and opposed the
separatist movements. Hitler and his associates were arrested when they went on a march of protest He was
imprisoned in the Fort of Landsberg. This was the time when Hitler started writing Mein Kampf (My
Struggle), which, more than an autobiography, was a declaration of his visions and plans for reclaiming the
glory of the German nation.

It contains stories from his childhood, the events and situations that influenced his ideologies, and his
prejudices. It explains his visions for German expansion through Europe, the Unification of Germany and
Austria, and his assertion of the superiority of the 'Aryan' Race. The book contains the seeds of the Nazi
vision for the mass extermination of the Jewish people.

Mein Kampf is the story of his life and a political manifesto that contains the beginnings of the ideas that
resulted in all the atrocities committed by the Nazi party.

The book is considered historically important for various reasons. One of them is to analyze and understand
how a single man was able to convince a whole nation to follow his ideas, good or bad. A study of the
factors that made people follow him on a path that led to a Second World War.



_____________________________________

About Adolf Hitler

Adolf Hitler was the Austrian born leader of the Nazi Party in Germany. He was born in 1889 in Austria. He
was a decorated veteran of the First World War.

He joined the German Workers Party and rose through its ranks. He gained a huge following in the country
with his Pan German vision and his racist, anti-Semitic, and anti-Marxist views. It was a period of social,
economic, and political unrest and people were willing to follow Hitler as he promised deliverance. When he
became the Chancellor in 1933, he transformed the democratic Weimar Republic into a single party
dictatorship governed by the Nazi Party, and declared himself the Fuhrer (Ruler) of the Third Reich.
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From reader reviews:

Antonio Duncan:

The book Mein Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories) can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the best thing like a book Mein
Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories)? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one
aim which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer along with your
book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you can share all of
these. Book Mein Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories) has simple shape however, you know: it has
great and large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a publication.
So it is very wonderful.

Kai Martin:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from
the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your own personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your cost-free time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the publication untitled Mein Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories) can be
excellent book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Curt Hall:

Exactly why? Because this Mein Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you with the secret the idea
inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the
content within easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good
for you for not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a
lot of positive aspects than the other book get such as help improving your proficiency and your critical
thinking way. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the book store
hurriedly.

Carlie Manson:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This specific Mein Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories)
can give you a lot of buddies because by you looking at this one book you have issue that they don't and
make you more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book
offer you information that might be your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than other make you to be
great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have Mein Kampf: My Struggle (Popular Life Stories).
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