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Dame Cecile Savoy was chewing the scenery. In her carefully programmed grief, she demanding that her co-
Thespian friends (actually more "rivals") accompany her to the taxidermist, where she is perpetuating the
body of her ancient Pekinese, "that revolting little floor mop she was so attached to," according to Trixie.
Finding the shop owner dead on the floor of his office was the first shock; finding the shop suddenly
enveloped in flames was the next, but the final blow to Dame Cecile was discovering that instead of rescuing
the remains of the expired Fleur de Lys, Trixie had snatched up a very much alive Japanese bobtail cat
named Cho Cho San.

Triple shock is only the beginning for our harried friends Trixie and Evangeline. In their own lives, as
opposed to those of the troublesome people who keep popping up, they are about to open in a play written
specially for them. But they are thrust into a whirlpool of trials and catastrophes involving other people, all
of which seriously cut into their time. A woman whose house guests they are battles with her much younger
stepmother over their father/husband's legacy, Their hostess's housekeeper goes missing, and is found dead
in the cellar. Evangeline inadvertently plies the guest who discovered the body with much more brandy than
she can handle just prior to her interview with a detective. And Martha, Trixie's daughter, is in a state of
panic about turning in the cookbook she is writing on time.

And then there's Cho Cho San. Somebody has to feed the poor beast standing in for the deceased Peke, (and
there's hardly any food in the house for the human guests.) Somebody has to reassure her when she is
frightened, find her when she is hiding, and give her the attention a nice cat deserves.

Babson's troops of fans will be delighted with this latest offering that typically combines a light touch and
some wildly funny situations.
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From reader reviews:

Diane Adams:

This The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is usually information inside this e-book incredible
fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This kind of
The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog without we comprehend teach the one who examining it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't be worry The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog can bring any time you are and not
make your bag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even
phone. This The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog having great arrangement in word and layout, so you will not feel
uninterested in reading.

Jerry Linton:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these people keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know what type you should start with. This The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog is
our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

Tony Caldwell:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book is usually option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
try out look for book, may be the book untitled The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog can be great book to read. May
be it might be best activity to you.

Frances York:

This The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog is completely new way for you who has attention to look for some
information since it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know
or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Cat Who Wasn't a Dog can be the light food to
suit your needs because the information inside this particular book is easy to get simply by anyone. These
books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book application
form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So
there isn't any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should
be here for you actually. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book kind for your better life and
knowledge.
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