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A deadly accident can take a life in more than one way.

Four years ago, Carlene Adams made a deadly mistake. A tragic accident derailed the future she'd hoped for,
taking the life of the man she'd planned to spend forever with.

As a self-imposed penance for her solitary sin, Carlene has given up on every dream she ever had. She has
committed to spend every remaining moment trying to make up for that one instance when everything
changed.

Then she gets a second chance.

When Carlene meets Nick Johnson, the single kiss they share awakens the desires she shoved aside for so
long. Suddenly she wants more than what she believe she deserves. Will she ever see him again?

A thing of fate.

Leaving the life she built on regret, Carlene waits for fate to intervene. But just as she begins to believe in a
fresh start, she's forced to realize a horrible truth—one with the power to send her second chance crashing
before it even takes off.

Nick isn't who she thought he was. She isn't the girl he believed her to be, either. Their lives were
intertwined even before they met, and if Carlene tells him the truth, she’ll risk tearing them apart—for good.
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From reader reviews:

Carmen Fields:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book particularly book entitled
Entangled Moments (Moments In Time Book 1) your mind will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each and every aspect that maybe not known for but surely will become your mind friends.
Imaging each and every word written in a book then become one form conclusion and explanation which
maybe you never get ahead of. The Entangled Moments (Moments In Time Book 1) giving you yet another
experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful info for your better life in this era. So
now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are
finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time
activity?

Joseph Taylor:

Beside this particular Entangled Moments (Moments In Time Book 1) in your phone, it could possibly give
you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are
going to got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an old people live in
narrow commune. It is good thing to have Entangled Moments (Moments In Time Book 1) because this book
offers to you readable information. Do you at times have book but you rarely get what it's about. Oh come
on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be
questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book along with
read it from right now!

Virgil Santamaria:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you are related
is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books in
the top collection in your reading list is usually Entangled Moments (Moments In Time Book 1). This book
and that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way
up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.

William Culley:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just seeking the Entangled Moments (Moments In Time Book 1) when you needed it?
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