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New York Times bestselling author Alex Kershaw is writing the first full biography of one of the most
remarkable men to have outwitted Hitler - Raoul Wallenberg, the young Swedish diplomat who almost
single-handedly saved the lives of countless Hungarian Jews, at unimaginable risk and great cost to himself.
As a Holocaust survivor said, 'Schindler saved hundreds. Wallenberg saved tens of thousands.' This is the
story of how he achieved this and of his personal duel with Adolf Eichmann, the SS colonel charged with
obliterating Hungarian Jewry, who sent half a million Jews to their deaths in Auschwitz. This confrontation
reaches its climax in 1944 when Soviet and German troops are fighting hand-to-hand through the suburbs of
Budapest and Eichmann's push for the Final Solution is personally opposed by Wallenberg. The book also
sheds new light on Wallenberg's fate - he disappeared into the Soviet Union after the war to a highly
controversial and disputed death. (The Americans were so determined to discover what happened to him that
they made him an honorary citizen in order to prise information out of the Russians.) It's an inspiring story
which moves at the pace of a master thriller-writer, but the truth behind it is heartbreaking.
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From reader reviews:

Nancy Sena:

The guide with title To Save a People posesses a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot
of profit after read this book. This particular book exist new expertise the information that exist in this
publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the
e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Annette Carroll:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love To Save a People, you can enjoy
both. It is very good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh come on
its mind hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Clarence Delapaz:

To Save a People can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight
away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to
understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort to get
every word into pleasure arrangement in writing To Save a People although doesn't forget the main position,
giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe you can be certainly
one of it. This great information may drawn you into fresh stage of crucial imagining.

Gerard Norman:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This To Save a People can be the respond to, oh how
comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era
is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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