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Will a forty-year-old woman with everything on the line – her high-stakes career, ticking biological clock,
bank account – risk it all for an intensely lusty secret romance with the one person who could destroy her
comeback, for good?

Jenna Jones, former It-girl fashion editor, is broke and desperate for a second chance. When she’s dumped
by her longtime fiancé and fired from Darling magazine, she begs for a job from her old arch nemesis, Darcy
Vale. The beyond-bitchy publisher of StyleZine.com, Darcy agrees to hire her rival – only because her
fashion site needs a jolt from Jenna’s old school cred. But Jenna soon realizes she’s in over her head. She’s
working with digital-savvy millennials half her age, has never even “Twittered,” and pretends to still be a
Fashion Somebody while living a style lie (she sold her designer wardrobe to afford her sketched-out studio,
and now quietly wears Walmart’s finest). Worse? The twenty-two-year-old videographer assigned to shoot
her web series is driving her crazy. Wildly sexy with a smile Jenna feels in her thighs, Eric Combs is way
off-limits – but almost too delicious too resist.

Written by the bestselling author of The Accidental Diva, The Perfect Find is a scandalously sexy, laugh-out-
loud funny, utterly quotable saga about star-crossed love and starting over.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Rodgers:

The feeling that you get from The Perfect Find is the more deep you looking the information that hide inside
the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to understand
but The Perfect Find giving you joy feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in a number of
way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this reserve is well-
known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then
can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this
kind of The Perfect Find instantly.

Robert Defazio:

This book untitled The Perfect Find to be one of several books that best seller in this year, honestly, that is
because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy that book in the
book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you
personally to past this guide from your list.

Jennifer Johnson:

This The Perfect Find is great reserve for you because the content which is full of information for you who
have always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it data
accurately using great organize word or we can claim no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this
hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tricky
core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Perfect Find in your hand like getting the
world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world
with ten or fifteen moment right but this book already do that. So , this is good reading book. Heya Mr. and
Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that will?

Robert Howard:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Perfect Find
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.
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