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Engineering Design with SolidWorks 2015 and video instruction is written to assist students, designers,
engineers and professionals. The book provides a solid foundation in SolidWorks by utilizing projects with
step-by-step instructions for the beginner to intermediate SolidWorks user. Explore the user interface,
CommandManager, menus, toolbars and modeling techniques to create parts, assemblies and drawings in an
engineering environment.

Follow the step-by-step instructions and develop multiple parts and assemblies that combine machined,
plastic and sheet metal components. Formulate the skills to create, modify and edit sketches and solid
features.

Learn the techniques to reuse features, parts and assemblies through symmetry, patterns, copied components,
Design Tables, Bills of Materials, Custom Properties and Configurations. Address various SolidWorks
analysis tools and Intelligent Modeling techniques along with Additive Manufacturing (3D printing). Learn
by doing not just by reading.

Desired outcomes and usage competencies are listed for each project. Know your objective up front. Follow
the steps in Projects 1 - 9 to achieve the design goals.

Review Project 10 on Additive Manufacturing (3D printing) and its benefits and features. Understand the
terms and technology used in low cost 3D printers.

Work between multiple documents, features, commands and custom properties that represent how engineers
and designers utilize SolidWorks in industry.

Review individual features, commands and tools with the Video Instruction. The projects contain exercises.
The exercises analyze and examine usage competencies. Collaborate with leading industry suppliers such as
SMC Corporation of America, Boston Gear and 80/20 Inc.

Collaborative information translates into numerous formats such as paper drawings, electronic files, rendered
images and animations. On-line intelligent catalogs guide designers to the product that meets both their
geometric requirements and performance functionality.

The author developed the industry scenarios by combining his own industry experience with the knowledge
of engineers, department managers, vendors and manufacturers. These professionals are directly involved
with SolidWorks every day. Their responsibilities go far beyond the creation of just a 3D model.

The book is designed to compliment the SolidWorks Tutorials contained in SolidWorks 2015.

View the provided videos in the book to enhance the user experience.

SolidWorks Interface●

2D Sketching, Sketch Planes and Sketch tools●



3D Features and Design Intent●

Creating an Assembly●

Fundamentals in Drawings Part 1 & Part 2●
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From reader reviews:

Dorinda Kling:

This book untitled Engineering Design with SolidWorks 2015 and Video Instruction to be one of several
books that will best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot
of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it via online.
The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, as you can read this
book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Clarice Johnson:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its cover may doesn't work this is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer can be Engineering Design with SolidWorks 2015 and Video Instruction why
because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The
inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly
assist you to pick up this book.

Ryan Parker:

The book untitled Engineering Design with SolidWorks 2015 and Video Instruction contain a lot of
information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by
famous author. The author will take you in the new period of time of literary works. You can read this book
because you can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book with anywhere and anytime.
If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice
examine.

Peggy Gillman:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This e-book Engineering Design with SolidWorks 2015 and Video Instruction
was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence.
Some people has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can
feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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