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From USA Today and Amazon Bestselling Romance Author S. E. Lund:

Eve Hayden had no idea what to expect the night she went in search of a translator for an 800-year old
French illuminated manuscript but it certainly wasn’t what she found -- Michel and Julien de Cernay: 800-
year old identical twin vampire brothers – beautiful, tempermental opposites, both wanting her for
themselves.

Michel -- dark, brooding, control-freak, former priest who broke his vows the night he was turned into a
vampire. Julien -- impetuous, valiant, passionate, a brave knight who lost his life on a battlefield when a
vampire claimed him.

Caught between the two brothers, Eve searches for the truth about her mother's death, her birth, and the fight
to prevent Dominion – vampire rule over humans. Eve's mother gave her life to keep Eve safe, but was
unable to protect herself. Now, Eve can't escape this fate nor can she escape the twins -- even if she wanted
to.

This is her story.

Note: Intended for 18+ for mature content.
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From reader reviews:

Luis Gray:

The book Dominion (The Dominion Series Book 1) can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a book Dominion (The
Dominion Series Book 1)? A number of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book
can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or
information that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Dominion
(The Dominion Series Book 1) has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you. You
can seem the enormous world by available and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Ian Coghlan:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Aim to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its cover
may doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because
fantastic as in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer could be Dominion (The Dominion Series Book
1) why because the great cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint
anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly assist you to pick up this book.

Carolyn Wilson:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This reserve Dominion (The Dominion Series Book 1) was filled regarding science.
Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several feel when
they reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a guide. In the
modern era like currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Joshua Yoshida:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book Dominion (The Dominion Series Book 1) was
multi-colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Dominion (The Dominion
Series Book 1) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. So , not at all of
book are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book in
your case and try to like reading in which.
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