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Growing up in the Tennessee hills, Alvin York was equally renowned as a marksman and as a hard-drinking
brawler. A dramatic New Year’s conversion convinced him that killing was against God’s will, and yet this
shy, big-boned mountaineer singlehandedly dispatched two dozen Germans and captured 132 in the closing
days of World War I. He earned the Medal of Honor and a ticker tape parade but refused to cash in on his
fame, insisting “Uncle Sam’s uniform ain’t for sale.”

This succinct and gripping new account of Sgt. York’s remarkable life includes details from exclusive
interviews with the sergeant’s three surviving children and information drawn from battlefield eyewitness
reports and original film studio archives: fresh reminders of the legacy of one of America’s great Christian
patriots.

We learn about life through the lives of others. Their experiences, their trials, their adventures become our
schools, our chapels, our playgrounds. Christian Encounters, a series of biographies from Thomas Nelson
Publishers, highlights important lives from all ages and areas of the Church through prose as accessible and
concise as it is personal and engaging. Some are familiar faces. Others are unexpected guests. Whether the
person is D.L. Moody, Sergeant York, Saint Nicholas, John Bunyan, or William F. Buckley, we are now
living in the world that they created and understand both it and ourselves better in the light of their lives.
Their relationships, struggles, prayers, and desires uniquely illuminate our shared experience.
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From reader reviews:

Quentin Ryan:

The book Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the best thing like a book Sergeant
York (Christian Encounters Series)? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that
book can give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book.
Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you are able to share all of
these. Book Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has
great and large function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a reserve. So it is
very wonderful.

Sheila Powell:

This Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book will be information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
particular Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) without we realize teach the one who reading through
it become critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't become worry Sergeant York (Christian Encounters
Series) can bring when you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' become full because you
can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series)
having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Daniel Ellis:

This book untitled Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) to be one of several books that best seller in
this year, this is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily
to buy this book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher with this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile
phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this reserve from your list.

Robert Shaw:

The book Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) will bring someone to the new experience of reading
some sort of book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to
study, this book very ideal to you. The book Sergeant York (Christian Encounters Series) is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more easily to
read the book.
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