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Song lyrics serve as markers on the time-line of our lives. They help us reminisce, reflect joy and sadness,
comfort us, inspire us and even give us hope. Passion! explores and reflects on a range of romance and
relationship matters incorporating themes of love, loss and loneliness.

Commentary after each set of lyrics or poem provides the reader with an insight as to the inspiration for the
lyrics, emotions that were difficult to verbalise at the time or a reflection and interpretation of the lyrics now.

The writing is strong in the use of literary techniques. The personification and repetition in 'Flames of the
Fire in the Hearth' drives the poem, while the imagery in 'the Earth Spins', 'Suicide', 'Winter' and 'The
Falconer' is vividly clear.

Emotions expressed through the writing are palpable. Tremendous sorrow and pain is expressed in 'Just a
Lie', 'Sometimes I Have to Cry' and 'Going Home', while anticipation and passion is revealed in 'Love of a
Simple Man'.

To balance the writing there is even a light-hearted look at flirtatious behaviour between the sexes in 'Miss
D. Meaner'.

Passion! and its companion book Rage! are worthwhile acquisitions for those who enjoy lyrical poetry and
thought provoking writing with good structure and use of literary devices.
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From reader reviews:

Fidel Auxier:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are really reading
whatever they take because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you should have this Passion! (Through My Eyes Book 1).

Lou Marshall:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach, or
picnic within the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to
test look for book, may be the book untitled Passion! (Through My Eyes Book 1) can be excellent book to
read. May be it could be best activity to you.

David Swanson:

You are able to spend your free time you just read this book this reserve. This Passion! (Through My Eyes
Book 1) is simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not
have got much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier
to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when one buys this book.

Jessica Harris:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is written or printed or created from each source which filled update of news. Within
this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
trying to find the Passion! (Through My Eyes Book 1) when you needed it?
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