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This collection focuses attention on an important but academically neglected area of contemporary
operational policing: the regulation of consensual sexual practices. Despite the high-level public visibility of,
and debate about, policing in relation to violent and abusive sexual crimes (from child sexual abuse to adult
rape) very little public or scholarly attention is paid to the policing of consensual sexual practices in
contemporary societies. Whilst ‘sexual life’ is commonly understood to be a matter of ‘private life’ that is
beyond formal social control, this book shows that policing is implicated in the regulation of a wide range of
consensual sexual practices. This book brings together a well known and respected group of academics, from
a range of disciplines, to explore the role of the police in shaping the boundaries of that aspect of our lives
that we imagine to be most intimate and most our own. The volume presents a ‘snap shot’ of policing in
respect of a number of diverse areas – such as public sex, pornography, and sex work – and considers how
sexual orientation structures police responses to them. The authors critically examine how policing is
implicated in the social, moral and political landscape of sex and, contrary to the established rhetoric of
politicians and criminal justice practitioners, continues to intervene in the private lives of citizens.

It is essential supplementary reading for courses in criminology, law, policing, sociology of deviance, gender
and sexuality, and cultural studies.
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From reader reviews:

Nola Schroeder:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be read.
Policing Sex can be your answer mainly because it can be read by anyone who have those short spare time
problems.

Esther Tackett:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you study a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply because
book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that
you have read. If you need to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon. The
Policing Sex provide you with new experience in studying a book.

Margarita Culbertson:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Policing Sex can be the solution, oh how comes?
A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new
era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

William Luke:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This reserve Policing Sex was filled with regards to science. Spend your free time to add your
knowledge about your research competence. Some people has different feel when they reading some sort of
book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern
era like today, many ways to get book you wanted.
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