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Is Treasure really out there? A resounding YES! Over $14 trillion dollars of it! Then why is “Treasure
Hunting” considered to be a dirty word and said in hushed tones? Why does so much of society not want
people hunting for Lost Treasures and Treasure Legends? The reasoning is simple: Many people DO NOT
want to see other people successful and rich beyond their wildest dreams. But now, more than ever Treasure
after Lost Treasure is being recovered. Thanks to better technology, better research tools and that good ol’
American Spirit and Determination! “10 Treasure Legends” is a simple book series. One book for each State
in the United States. The 10 Treasure Legends inside this work are legends of buried or lost treasure and
fortunes. If you are willing to separate fact from fiction – who knows? You might be the one to find them
and make history. These Treasure Legends have been around a long time, and time after time people have
wanted to or claimed to go after them, but the truth is – they are still lost and out there for someone like you
to find. Not a lot of technical how to or educational mumbo-jumbo in this series; only the legends as best as
the legends can be retold. But, there are some tools included should you get excited and decide to research,
investigate and either prove or disprove these Treasure Legends for yourself. Go Treasure and Lost History
Hunting with COMMANDER Hutton Pulitzer of ExpeditionHistory.org and TreasureForce. The World's
Foremost History Expedition and Terrestrial Treasure Recovery Team and COMMANDER plans and
manages missions all around the globe. TreasureForce combines historical re-enactments and forensic
research with the most advanced tools and instruments in the world to locate and recover famous Lost
Treasures and to either prove or disprove various Treasure Legends. As an Inventor, Commander Pulitzer is
globally one of the foremost Inventors in modern times, recognized as one of the "Top 50 Inventors in the
World", and as an Author, he has published over 200 individual History and Treasure Hunting titles.
Cacheology Society of America and the Cacheology Society and Institute of the United Kingdom are the
governing and certification boards of Certified Cacheologists. Cacheology: The profession, whereby highly
trained and certified individuals, using archaeological methods combined with forensic historical research
and modern technology, set out to either prove or disprove, dispel or recover, set the historical record straight
or professionally document, the various types of caches, common treasures or otherwise, that have been lost
to history and mankind. The mission of the Cacheologists is to recover lost caches, using profit driven
methods, for the expansion of mankind's study, education, instruction, collecting, showcasing, and the
preservation of caches that time and the environment rapidly and thoroughly destroy, thus erasing vital and
irreplaceable historical records and artifacts of the entire world.
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From reader reviews:

Erma Ward:

The book untitled 10 Treasure Legends! New Jersey: Lost Gold, Hidden Hoards and Fantastic Fortunes is the
publication that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown
to you actually. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, to ensure the information that they
share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of 10 Treasure Legends!
New Jersey: Lost Gold, Hidden Hoards and Fantastic Fortunes from the publisher to make you far more
enjoy free time.

Sammy Cheney:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not attempting 10 Treasure Legends! New
Jersey: Lost Gold, Hidden Hoards and Fantastic Fortunes that give your entertainment preference will be
satisfied by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for people to
know world better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading
practice only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So ,
for all you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you could pick 10 Treasure Legends! New
Jersey: Lost Gold, Hidden Hoards and Fantastic Fortunes become your starter.

Edward Cottrell:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of
book that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and also soon. The 10 Treasure Legends! New Jersey: Lost Gold, Hidden Hoards and Fantastic Fortunes
offer you a new experience in reading a book.

Thomas Rojas:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real
their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As
we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways



to reach Chinese's country. So , this 10 Treasure Legends! New Jersey: Lost Gold, Hidden Hoards and
Fantastic Fortunes can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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